
 
 

THE STATES OF DELIBERATION  
of the 

ISLAND OF GUERNSEY 
 

6th November, 2018 
 

Proposition No. P.2018/108 
 

Policy & Resources Committee 
 

The States of Guernsey Annual Budget for 2019 
 

AMENDMENT  
 
 
Proposed by: Deputy M H Dorey 
Seconded by: Deputy C J Green 
 
 
In proposition 29 – 
 
a) immediately after ""The Taxation of Real Property (Guernsey and Alderney) 

(Amendment) Ordinance, 2018"" insert ", subject to the amendment indicated 
below", and 

 
b) immediately after the proposition, insert the following amendment to the 

Ordinance - 
 
"Amendment 
 
In the Schedule to the Ordinance in the entries in: 
 

i. Table (A) "GUERNSEY REAL PROPERTY - GUERNSEY BUILDINGS" relating to B2.1 
(in the first column) and Domestic (whole unit) Open Market with a plan area 
of less than 500 assessable units) (in the second column), for "£1.67" (in the 
third column) substitute "£2.67"" 
 

ii. Table (A) "GUERNSEY REAL PROPERTY - GUERNSEY BUILDINGS" relating to B2.2 
(in the first column) and Domestic (flat) Open Market with a plan area of less 
than 500 assessable units) (in the second column), for "£1.67" (in the third 
column) substitute "£2.67"" 
 

iii. Table (A) "GUERNSEY REAL PROPERTY - GUERNSEY BUILDINGS" relating to B2.4 
(in the first column) and Domestic (outbuildings) Open Market (in the second 
column), for "84p" (in the third column) substitute "£1.34"" 
 

 

cfoster
Typewritten text
P.2018/108 Amdt 6

cfoster
Rectangle



 
 

In proposition 37, to insert at the end of the words: 
 
 “, but with the addition of £390,000 to the cash limit for the Overseas Aid & 

Development Commission” 
 

Explanatory note 
 
These increases in the Open Market Guernsey Buildings tariffs will raise an additional 
£390,000 per annum, compared to those proposed in the 2019 Budget Report. 


